BID OPENING MARCH 23, 2021

5. VARIOUS SEALED/CONTAINED GASES AND/OR TANKS -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 78 vendors)

RFB #20-0050

Central Gas Service, LLC Lampton Welding Supply
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Received Received
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes

Matheson Propane Central
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Received Received
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes
Wichita Welding Supply, Inc.
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Received
Acknowledge Addendum Yes
Boone Opportunities Grainger Industrial Supply
No Bid Heathwood Oil Co., Inc. Murdock Companies Inc.

Petroleum Traders Corp

Security Oil LLC

Wayman Oil Co.




BID OPENING MARCH 23, 2021

5. VARIOUS SEALED/CONTAINED GASES AND/OR TANKS -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING — VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 78 vendors)

RFB #20-0050

Central Gas Service,|  Propane | Wichita Welding Lampton e—
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Central Supply. Inc | Welding Supply
Tract I: Liquid Propanc (LP) Gas and/or Tanks
Liquid Propane Gas Commodity
Liquid Propane Gas (100Ib. Tank or less) $2.75 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Liquid Propanc Gas (100lb, Tank or greater) $2.75 S1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
New or Replacement Tank(s)
20 Ib. tank (consumer grilling LP tank) $47.05 new $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,750 +
$350 parts +
300 gallon above ground tank $1,698.00new | S6'trenching No Bid No Bid No Bid
pipe +
$75.00/hr labor
2250+
$350 parts +
500 gallon above ground tank $2,215.20 new $6' trenching No Bid No Bid No Bid
pipe +
§75.00/hr labor
$3.950 +
$350 parts +
1,000 gallon above ground tank $3,664.80 new | S6'trenching No Bid No Bid No Bid
pipe +
$75.00/hr labor
MSRP Discount Rate off any Acetylene Cylinder na 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rate off any purchase not outlined above
Cylinder Rental
20 Ib. tank (consumer grilling LP tank) $5.00 n/c on rental No Bid No Bid No Bid
300 gallon above ground tank $5.00 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 gallon above ground tank $10.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1,000 gallon above ground tank $15.00 $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MSRP Discount Rate off any Propane Cylinder " o No Bid No Bid No Bid
rental rate not outlined above
Itemized Propane Gas Usage by Department
Infrequent; As
1355 S 383rd St. W 1Ea;
1 ¢ - . 1.1 1.69 No Bi No Bi No Bi
Emergency Communications — Radio Shop Chenes, K5 67025 1,000 gaons Needed (25 S1.10 $1.6 o Bid o Bid o Bid
gallons)
17500 W. 71st S. 1 E: Infrequent; As
Emergency Communications — Radio Shop Viola, KS 67149 Needed (25 S1.10 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1,000 gallons
(Clonmel Yard) gallons)
2501 S. 2315t ST. W. i Infrequent; As
Emergency Communications — Radio Shop Goddard, KS 67052 000 o Needed (25 S1.10 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(231d S and 2315t W) 000 gallons gallons)
10270 S. 127th St. E. Infrequent; As
roquent;
- Derby, KS 67037 1Ea; ’
g . - 3 2. 1.69 No B No B No B
Emergency Communications — Radio Shop (B0t S and 1270 E 1,000 gaflons Ncc;m :»25 $2.00 $1.6 o Bid o Bid o Bid
then South % mile) &
. 0030 E“il No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lake Afion 009 gallons
Parks 24600 W 39th S 5 Ea; 3,200 gallons S1.10 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goddard, KS 67052 500 gallons
TE
No Bi No Bi No Bi
200 gallons o Bid o Bid o Bid
Scdgwick County Park |1 Fa.. 1,000 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid
Park Y 2L 1,300 gall S1.10 $1.69
arks 6501 W 21st StN 3 Ea.. 500 gallons 300 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fire Station 39 e
Sedgwick County Fire District 1 3610 S. 263rd St. West 1,000 sailons 3,000 gallons $1.10 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Garden Plain, KS 67050 o0
Shooting Range | Ea
Sedgwick County Sheriff's Office 24532 W 39¢h St. S S0 b 2,200 gallons* $1.10 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goddard, KS 67052 galons
Central Gas Service,|  Propane | Wichita Welding Lampton I
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Central Supply, Inc Welding Supply
Tract 2: Medical Grade Oxygen
Medical Grade Oxygen PICK UP SUMMARY -
OXYGEN GAS
Uniit of Measure RS Price Per Unit of | Price Per Unit Price Per Unit of Price Per Unit of | Price Per Unit of
Quantity/Expected Annual Usage - Measure of Measure Measure Measure Measure
7 M Cylinder Vendor Service Location No Bid No Bid §7.32/Ea, No Bid $9.03
537 Jumbo D Cylinder Vendor Service Location No Bid No Bid $7.32/Ea. No Bid $5.25
Infrequent; As needed by Departments (1) E Size Cylinder Vendor Service Location No Bid No Bid $7.32/Ea. No Bid $5.30
Medical Grade Oxygen DELIVERED SUMMARY
Annual Pricing per Department (Per Pricing should
match ltemized Pricing Per Cylinder)
. Vehicle Price per ) Price per Price per
Department Cylinder Type Safety Stock Quanti ! Total Required Price per Cylinder Price per Cylinder
i ' P y Stock QuaNity | guantity 5 = Cylinder perty! Cylinder Cylinder
Sedgwick County EMS M Cylinder %0 30 72 No Bid No Bid 51036 No Bid 9.03
Scdgwick County EMS Jumbo D Cylinder 165 75 240 No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid 5.5
Sedgwick County Fire Dept Jumbo D Cylinder B 27 % No Bid No Bid 51036 No Bid 525
Wichita Fire Dept. Jumbo D Cylinder 124 6 189 No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid 5.5
Derby Fire Dept. Jumbo D Cylinder 12 6 13 No Bid No Bid 51036 No Bid 525
Site Addresses and Cylinder Quantities for Medical
Grade Oxygen:
Medical Grade Oxygen DELIVERED ITEMIZED
liemized Pricing per Department Location
DELIVERED (Per Pricing should match Annual
Pricing Per Department)
Jumbo D Cylinder | M D" | \go Cylinder Safety Stock | "M" Cylinder Vehicte Price per Price per Price per
Sedgwick County Fire Stations Address u Y Vehicle 24 1y Y Price per Cylinder P Price per Cylinder P P
Safety Stock (Sations) | 01 (Stations) Quantity Cylinder Cylinder Cylinder
Station 31 S848 N. 2470 St. W. 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Andale, KS 67001
Station 32 7750N. Wild West Dr. 1 4 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.25
Park City. KS 67147
Station 33 10625 W 53rd St. N 9 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Maize. KS 67101
Station 34 334N, Main 7 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.25
Haysville, KS 67050
Station 35 1535 S. 199th St. W s 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.25
Goddard. KS 67052
Station 36 30358 Oliver St s 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.25
Wichita, KS 67210
Station 37 4343 N. Woodlawn Bivd 8 4 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25

Bel Aire, KS 67220




1010 N. 143+d St. E.

Station 38 7 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67230
3610S. 263rd St. W.
Station 39 7 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Garden Plain, KS 67052
Jumbo D Cylinder | M D" | pgo Cylinder Safety Stock | "M" Cylinder Vehicte Price per Price per Price per
Wichita Fire Stations Address u Y Vehicle 4 1y Y Price per Cylinder A Price per Cylinder P! P
Safety Stock (Sations) | 1 (Stations) Quantity Cylinder Cylinder Cylinder
Station 1 731 N Main 12 8 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67203
Station 2 1240 S Broadway 1 7 - - No Bid No Bid $1036 No Bid $5.25
Wichita, KS 67211
Station 3 3261 N Broadway 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67219
Station 4 2423 Wrving 7 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67213
Station 5 257 N Hillside 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $1036 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67214
Station 7 2346 N Coolidge 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67204
Station 8 601 N Elder 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67212
Station 9 330 S Edgemoor 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67218
Station 10 2950 E21st SUN 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67206
1845 George
Station 11 Washington Blvd 6 3 - E No Bid No Bid $1036 No Bid $5.25
Wichita, KS 67218
Station 12 3443 S Meridian 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.5
Wichita, KS 67217
Station 13 3162 W 420d StN 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.5
Wichita, KS 67204
6408 Farmview East
Station 14 Lane 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.25
Wichita, KS 67206
Station 15 7923 E Lincoln 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 16 1632 N'Tyler 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67212
Station 17 10651 W Maple 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67209
Station 18 2808 N Webb 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67226
Station 19 4440 S Broadway 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67216
Station 20 2235 8 Greenwich 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 21 210N 135th St W 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67235
Station 22 2659 S Hydraulic 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid §5.25
Wichita, KS 67211
Jumbo D Cylinder | ™M D" | pgo Cylinder Safety Stock | "M" Cylinder Vehicte Price per Price per Price per
Derby Fire Station Address u g Vehicle 4 1y Y Price per Cylinder P! Price per Cylinder P! P
Safety Stock (Sations) | 01 (Stations) Quantity Cylinder Cylinder Cylinder
Station 81 715 E. Madison 12 6 - - No Bid No Bid $10.36 No Bid $5.5
Derby, KS 67037
Jumbo D Cylinder | M D" | \go Cylinder Safety Stock | "M" Cylinder Vehicte Price per Price per Price per
Sedgwick County EMS Address u g Vehicle 4 1y Y Price per Cylinder A Price per Cylinder P! P
Safety Stock (Sations) | 01 (Stations) Quantity Cylinder Cylinder Cylinder
Via Christi St. Francis 929 N. St Francis 50 20 20 10 No Bid No Bid $1036 No Bid D$5.25,
Wichita, KS 67214 M $9.03
Wesley Medical Center 330 E. Hillside 50 20 R 10 No Bid No Bid 51036 No Bid D $5.25;
Wichita, KS 67214 M $9.03
Via Christi St. Joseph 3400 8. Grand 50 20 20 10 NoBid NoBid $1036 No Bid D $5.25;
Wichita, KS 67218 M $9.03
Via Christi St Teresa 14800 W_ St. Tercsa s s i 5 NoBid NoBid 1036 NoBid D$5.25;
Wichita, KS 67235 M $9.03
Medical Grade Oxygen PICK UP SUMMARY - CY LINDER RENTAL [
. Price Per . Price Per Price Per
AR Cylinder | rice Per Cylinder  |Cylinder
Quantity/Expected Annual Usage Unit of Measure Address Cylinder Rental 4 Cylinder Rental 4 4
(Monthly) Rental (Monthly) Rental Rental
(Monthly) (Monthly) (Monthly)
$1.50
Vendor Seni /County
72 M Cylinder enmo r Service No Bid No Bid 7.32/ca No Bid department to
cation PICK UP at
Service
Location
$1.50
) /County
. ‘Vendor Service
537 Jumbo D Cylinder Location No Bid No Bid 7.32/ca No Bid department to
PICK UP at
Service
Location
$1.50
Vendor Servi /County
. ' endor Service
Infrequent; As Needed by Departments (1) E Size Cylinder . No Bid No Bid 7.32/ca No Bid department to
Location
PICK UP at
Service
Location
Medical Grade Oxygen DELIVERED SUMMARY - CY LINDER RENTAL
‘Annual Pricing per Department (Per Pricing should
match totaled ltemized Pricing Per Department
Location)
Price per .
. - Price per Price per
Department Cylinder Type Safety Stock Quantity | VoMCle Total Required WEEsCyI | ik || IREREIT | e o i (e imina
Quantity Rental (Monthly) | Rental | Rental (Monthly) |~ Fr, )
(Monthly) 4 2
Scdgwick County EMS M Cylinder %0 30 72 No Bid No Bid 2.50 No Bid 150
Sedgwick County EMS Jumbo D Cylinder 165 75 240 No Bid No Bid 2.00 No Bid 1.50
Sedgwick County Fire Dept Jumbo D Cylinder 6 7 % No Bid No Bid 2.00 No Bid 150
Wichita Fire Dept. Jumbo D Cylinder 124 65 189 No Bid No Bid 2.00 No Bid 1.50
Derby Fire Dept. Jumbo D Cylinder B 3 18 No Bid No Bid 2.00 No Bid 150
Site Addresses and Cylinder Quantities for Medical
Grade Oxygen:
Medical Grade Oxygen DELIVERED ITEMIZED
liemized Pricing per Department Location
DELIVERED (Per Pricing should match totaled
Annual Pricing Per Department)




Jumbo D' Price per rcebey Price per Price per Price per
Sedgwick County Fire Stations Address . ;IL;TbSut;)'k (‘S'l’a":‘f;s‘ Vehicle | ™ Cyl";d;‘ ::S'y S| Cg"‘;ﬁ;“"‘“‘“ Cylinder/Cage Cy";‘:"‘; f"‘gc Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage
y Stod Quantity @ antity Rental (Monthly) (Monthly) Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Monthly)
s
Station 31 S848 N. 2470 St. W 4 2 - - No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Andale, KS 67001
ETTIETT NS
Station 31 Cylinder Cage 5848 N. 247th St W No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Andale, KS 67001
Station 32 7750 N. Wild West Dr. No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Park City. KS 67147
5 .
Station 32 Cyinder Cage 7750 N. Wild West Dr No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Park Citv. KS 67147
75 W 53rd S
Station 33 10625 W 53rd St. N No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Maize. KS 67101
25 W S3rd S
Station 33 Cylinder Cage 10625 W 53rd St. N No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Maize, KS 67101
Station 34 334N, Main No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Haysville, KS 67050
Station 34 Cylinder Cage 334 N. Main No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Haysville, KS 67050
Station 35 1535 S. 199th St. W. No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Goddard, KS 67052
Station 35 Cylinder Cage 1535 5. 199th St. W. No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Goddard, KS 67052
Station 36 3055 S Oliver St No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67210
Station 36 Cylinder Cage 3055 S Oliver St No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67210
Station 37 4343 N. Woodlawn Bivd No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Bel Aire. KS 67220
Station 37 Cylinder Cage 4343 N. Woodlawn Bivd No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Bel Aire. KS 67220
Station 38 J010N. 1431 St. E No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67230
Station 38 Cylinder Cage 1010 N. 143rd St. E No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67230
3610'S. 263rd St. W
Station 39 A ) No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Garden Plain, KS 67052
3610S. 263rd St. W.
Station 39 Cylinder Cage No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Garden Plain, KS 67052
Price per .
. JumboD' |, e Price per N Price per Price per Price per
Wichita Fire Stations Address s :IL;Tb;l;)'kcélll:::;s\ Vehicle | Cyl";d;‘ ::S'y S| Cg"‘;ﬁ;“"‘“‘“ Cylinder/Cage C"‘;‘:"‘; f"‘gc Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage
R Quantity @ LEily Rental (onthy) |35 | Rental (Monhly) | Renal (Monihl) | Renal (Morihly)
Station 1 731 N Main No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67203
Station 1 Cylinder Cage 731N Main No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67203
Station 2 1240 S Broadway No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67211
Station 2 Cylinder C 1240 S Broadway No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67211
Station 3 3261 N Broadway No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67219
Station 3 Cylinder Cage 3261 N Broadway No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67219
Station 4 2423 Wrving No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67213
Station 4 Cylinder Cage 2423 W lrving No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67213
Station 5 257 N Hillside No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67214
Station 5 Cylinder Cage 257 N Hillside No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67214
Station 7 2346 N Coolidze No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67204
Station 7 Cylinder Cage 2346 N Coolidze No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67204
Station 8 601 N Elder No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67212
Station § Cylinder Cage 661 N Elder No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67212
Station 9 330 S Edgemoor No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67218
Station 9 Cylinder Cage 350 § Edgemoor No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67218
Station 10 2950 E 215t SUN No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67206
Station 10 Cylinder Cage 2950 E21st StN No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67206
1845 Goorge
Station 11 Washington Bivd No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita. KS 67218
1845 George
Station 11 Cylinder Cage Washington Blvd No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67218
Station 12 3443 S Meridian No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67217
Station 12 Cylinder Cage 3443 S Meridian No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67217
Station 13 3162 W 42nd StN No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67204
Station 13 Cylinder Cage 3162 W 42nd SN No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67204
6408 Farmview East
Station 14 Lane No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67206
6408 Farmview East
Station 14 Cylinder Cage Lane No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67206
Station 15 7923 E Lincoln No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 15 Cylinder Cage 7923 E Lincoln No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 16 1632 N'Tyler No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67212
Station 16 Cylinder Cage 1632 N Tyler No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67212
Station 17 10651 W Maple No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67209
Station 17 Cylinder Cage 10651 W Maple No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67209
Station 18 2808 N Webb No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67226
Station 18 Cylinder Cage 2808 N Webb No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67226
Station 19 4440 S Broadway 6 3 - - No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50

Wichita, KS 67216




Wesley Medical Center Cylinder Cage

Wichita, KS 67214

provides their own
Cylinder Cage

provides their
own Cylinder

provides their own
Cylinder Cage

provides their
own Cylinder

Station 19 Cylinder Cage 4440 S Broadway No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67216
Station 20 2255 S Greemwich No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 20 Cylinder Cage i No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67207
Station 21 2110 N 135th St W No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67235
Station 21 Cylinder Cage et No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67235
Station 22 2659 S Hydraulic No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67211
Station 22 Cylinder Cage 2659 S Hydraulic No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
- - Wichita, KS 67211
Price per )
— Jumbo D' |, ) g ) Price per Price per Price per Price per
e o
Derby Fire Station it s :f‘;‘;h;‘:zkcél‘:‘dgs) Vehicle | ™M Cyl'(';d‘:;:::f'y Sccd Y Cg:'::"’ ainsts Cylinder/Cage | <Y’ ";d:n::‘f“ge Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage
Y Quanity "y Rental (Montly) | 7| Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Morhly)
Station 81 715 E. Madison 12 6 - - No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50
Derby, KS 67037
Station 81 Cylinder Cage 715 E. Madison No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $15.00
Derby, KS 67037
Price per
— Jumbo D' |, ) g » Price per Price per Price per Price per
Sedgwick County EMS Address s :f‘;‘;h;‘:zkcél‘:‘dgs) vemae || Cyl;';d‘:;:::f‘y Sccd Y Cg:‘::"’ VEHTED CylinderiCage | <Y’ ";d:n::‘ f“ge Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage | Cylinder/Cage
- Quantity "y Rental (Monthly) (Monthly) Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Monthly) | Rental (Monthly)
Via Christi St. Francis 929 N. St Francis No Bid No Bid D -$2.00; No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67214 M - $2.50
. -
Via Christi St. Francis Cylinder Cage air":us‘l(lsr?;zﬁu No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $15.00
Wesley Medical Center 350E. Hillside No Bid No Bid D -$2.00; No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67214 M-52.50
550 E. Hillside ™ - T
NA - Hospial | NA-Hospial [ | NA-Hospial [ NA - Hospial

provides their
own Cylinder

Viola, KS 67149

Cage Cage Cage
; 5 —
Via Christi St. Joseph 3400 E. Grand No Bid No Bid D -$2.00; No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67218 M- $2.50
Via Christi St. Joseph Cylinder Cage 3400 E. Grand No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67218
T )
Via Christi St. Teresa 14800 W. St. Teresa No Bid No Bid D - $2.00; No Bid $1.50
Wichita, KS 67235 M-$2.50
Via Christi St. Teresa Cylinder Cage 14800 W. St. Teresa No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $15.00
Wichita, KS 67235
Central Gas Service,|  Propane | Wichita Welding Lampton
Central Supply, I Welding Supply [ Matheson
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks Gatiel PRI Gl
Tract 3: All Other Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks
DELIVERED ITEMIZED
Price per LEEORE Price per Price per Price per
Cylinder/Refill C(ryel;‘:;ﬁ ‘::gi.' Cyli Cy Cyli
Department Address Gas Cylinder/Tank | g ivated Annual Usage regardless of Cylinder Gpmlnd || EZEloe || EEmitnd
Size Cylinder ownership | ¥ M| Cylinder ownership | Cylinder Cylinder
status -owned or P | Status -owned or | ownership status -| ownership status -
status -owned
rented) rented) owned or rented) | owned or rented)
or rented)
700 S Hydraulic o |MC 1016547 Infrequent; As Needed .
y Y 2H2 No B No B No Bid 19.5 9.25
Facilities Management Wit be el Acetylene (C2H2) ol o am) 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $19.50 5
700 S Hydraulic Infrequent; As Needed (2] .
acilities Manag ; gon ( No B No B No Bid 16.01 0
Facilities Management Wit pe ety Argon (Ar) 201 o 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 $6.06
700 S Hydraulic N A .
acilities Manag y en (02 As No B No B No Bid 15.01 534
Facilities Management Wit bS el Oxygen (02) 201, Infrequent; As Needed 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $15.00 5
700 S Hydraulic : N Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag y sen (N2 No B No B No Bid 16.01 5.5
Facilities Management Wit pe ety Nitrogen (N2) 401, L 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 $5.50
622 E Central Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag ; No B No B No Bid 15.01 0
Facilities Management Wit K8 63214 Oxygen (CO2) 201 s 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $15.00 $6.06
622 E Central Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag . 2H2 NoBi NoB No Bid 25.01 11.59
Facilities Management Wit K8 69214 Acetylene (C2H2) 201 s 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $25.00 $
622 E Central : Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag sen (N2 No B No B No Bid 16.01 5.5
Facilities Management Wit K8 63214 Nitrogen (N2) 401, ) 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 $5.50
Carbon Dioxide (CO2)
Facilities Management 141 W Elm Mix (75% Argon/25% 150 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 $11.54
Wichita, KS 67203 . (I'aty)
c02)
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag gon (4 y NoB No B No Bid 2401 2
Facilities Management Wichin KS 62203 Argon (Ar) 80 cf i 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $24.00 §8.7
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag Ac 2 : No B No B No Bid 41,01 11.59
Facilities Management Wichin KS 6203 Acetylene # 60 cf L 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $41.00 s
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed .
acilities Manag en (02 : No B No B No Bid 19.01 s
Facilities Management Wichin KS 62203 Oxygen (02) 80 cf L 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $19.00 §5.80
Facilities e Dissolved Acetylene Unl001 TR A e No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 -
Carbon Dioxide (CO2) A
525 s . s
Facilitics Management 525 Main St Mix (75% Argon/25% Mix § Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 S11.54
¢ Wichita, KS 67203 S (ay)
co2) i
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed ’
. yE ; No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 10.90
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Oxygen (02) T iy o Bi o Bi o Bi s
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed ’
. ; No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 6.06
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Oxygen (02) R i o Bi o Bi o Bi s
525 Main St . Infrequent; As Needed ’ ,
. J No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 33.33
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) Alds iy o Bi o Bi o Bi s
525 Main St . Infrequent; As Needed ’ -
. J No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 11.59
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) B iy o Bi o Bi o Bi s
525 Main St . . Infrequent; As Needed ’ ,
. J No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 9.25
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) MC i o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
525 Main St - Infrequent; As Needed ’
. : ; No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.00 .82
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Argon (Ar) s i o Bi o Bi o Bi s
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed ’
. . / J No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 -
Facilities Management Wichin, KS 67203 Nitrogen (N2) v o o Bi o Bi o Bi
1021 Stillwell Wichita, . Small (4) & !
; . No Bid No Bid No Bid - .
Flect Management XS s Acetylene (C2H2) T (| Infequents As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi
1021 Stillwell Wichita, Small (1) & !
; . . No Bid No Bid No Bid - .
Flect Management XS s Argon (Ar) T (4| Infiequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi
Fleet Management 1021 S:E‘;;'Z'n ichits, Nitrogen (N2) Large (1) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
1021 Stillwell Wichita, Small (6) & !
: . xye : No Bid No Bid No Bid E -
Flect Management XS 6ras Oxygen (02) T | Infiequents As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi
3,600 Ibs (@00
.
Health Department 1500 E9StN. Dried Iee N/A | Ibs/Month March No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wichita, KS 67214
October)
2716 W. Central Ave. N ! s
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 20.65
Health Department Wikl KS o720 | Liuid Nivogen (LN2) | 18 liter 5 gallons o Bi o Bi o Bi B
Py
Public Works 3858 2477 St W Acetylene #4 96-147CF 915 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Andale, KS 67001 Y
Py
Public Works 3858 2477 St W Acetylene #5 228.441CF 282 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
Andale, KS 67001 i
247" 25
Public Works 3858 2477 St W Oxygen 125.251CF 2,128 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-58.90;
Andale, KS 67001 ve 251-59.90
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Acetylene #4 96147 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Viola, KS 67149 ¥
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Acetylene #5 208441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86




W 75
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-$8.90;
Viola, KS 67149 - 251-89.90
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $19.80
Viola, KS 67149
) 2200 S Webb Rd )
vl # - 5
Public Works Wi, K 61207 Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infiequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
2200'S Webb Rd
c Ac 228~ c! fr . No Bi No Bi No Bid 145
Public Works. Wichita, KS 67207 Acetylene #5 28-441 cf Infrequent; As Needed o Bid o Bid 0 Bid $ 00 $86.86
) 2200 S Webb Rd B o 125-58.90;
XY 25-25 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00
Public Works Wi, K 61207 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi 500
o
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Wichita, KS 67226 i
m
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Acetylene #5 208441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
Wichita, KS 67226 i
i 25-
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-$8.90;
Wichita, KS 67226 - 251-89.90
. 4701 S West St .
vl # - 5
Public Works Wt KS 67217 Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infiequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
. 4701 S West St .
Public Works Wit KS 67217 Acetylene #5 28441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
. 4701 S West St 5 R 125-$8.90;
XY 25-25 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00
Public Works Wetita KS 67217 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi 500
. 1015 Stillwell #16 .
vl # - 5
Public Works Wikt K8 61213 Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infiequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
. 1015 Stillwell #16 .
Public Works Wikt K6 61213 Acetylene #5 28441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
. 1015 Stillwell #16 5 R 125-$8.90;
XY 25-25 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00
Public Works Wikt K6 61213 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi 500
. 1015 Stillwell #16 Py i
Public Works Wichita, KS 67213 Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $19.80
T . 1109 N. Minneapolis | Ultra-High Pure Argon N
3 No Bid No Bid No Bid 222.74
Regional Forensic Science Center Wit K8 oot o T (330 ¢ 2 gallons o Bi o Bi 0 B B $26.10
" - . 1109 N. Minneapolis -~ .
) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2086 y
Regional Forensic Science Center o K8 gy | Regular Compressed Air| T (330 cf) 4 gallons o Bi o Bi 0 B $9.00
" - " y 1109 N. Minneapolis Ultra-High Pure Helium .
3 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 247.84
Regional Forensic Science Center Wit K8 oot s T (330.cf) 0 gallons o Bi o Bi 0 B B $118.18
" - . 1109 N. Minneapolis . .
X - 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.34 30.75
Regional Forensic Science Center Wi K8 g | Ulra-Hih Pure Nitvogen | T (330 cf) 18 gallons o Bi o Bi 0 B $30.7
- - . . 7750 N. Wild West Dr. Infrequent; As Needed "
, i Xy J No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 .
Sedgvick County Fire Disiet #1 Strion 32| 128V WG NE0 Oxygen (02) Q e o Bi o Bi o Bi §5.80
) Carbon Dioxide (CO2)
Emergency Communications Radio Shop 1021 Stillwell Wichita, | ;750 Argon/25% | 150 CF Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 S11.54
KS 67213
co2)
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks
PICKED UP AT VENDOR SERVICE LOCATION
ITEMIZED
v v Price per Cylinder |  Priceper | Price per Cylinder | Price per Price per
Department Address Gas Cy"";;f i (If::":“v;:i’:::‘:t E::ie) Rental Fee  |Cylinder Rental|  Rental Fee Cylinder Rental | Cylinder Rental
2 (Monthly) | Fee (Monthly) | (Monthly) Fee (Monthly) | Fee (Monthly)
-, 700 S Hydraulic . MC 10 Ib.; Infrequent; As Needed "
S o No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 9.25
Facilities Management Watin 58 6211 Acetylene (C2H2) A T o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
N~ 700 S Hydraulic Infrequent; As Needed )
No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 6.06
Facilities Management Watin 58 6211 Argon (Ar) 201 T o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
Facilities Management 700 S Hydraulic Oxygen (02) 201b. Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 §5.34
Wichita, KS 67211 Y :
-~ 700 S Hydraulic ) Infrequent; As Needed )
No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 5.50
Facilities Management Watin 58 6211 Nitrogen (N2) a0 e o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
SR 622 E Central . 5 Infrequent; As Needed "
XY 2, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 6.06
Facilities Management Wetta K8 61014 Oxygen (CO2) 0 1b e o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
SR 622 E Central . s Infrequent; As Needed "
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 1159
Facilities Management Watta K8 61214 Acetylene (C2H2) 0 1b e o Bi o Bi o Bi $
SR 622 E Central N Infrequent; As Needed "
3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 5.50
Facilities Management Wetta KS 63214 Nitrogen (N2) a0 o o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
Carbon Dioxide (CO2) _—
Facilities Management 141w Elm Mix (75% Argon/25% 150 f Infrequent As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 S11.54
Wichita, KS 67203 cort (1qty)
S 141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed "
J No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 5.72
Facilities Management Wichita, KS 67203 Argon (Ar) 80 cf o 0 Bi 0 Bi o Bi 5
SR 141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed "
lene f d No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.00 1159
Facilities Management Wichita, KS 61203 Acetylene #2 60 cf e o Bi o Bi o Bi $
SR 141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed "
1 J No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 5.80
Facilities Management Wichita, KS 61203 Oxygen (02) 80 cf e o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
SR 141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed "
’ J No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 .
Facilities Management Wichia. KS G203 | Dissolved Aceiylene | Unt0ot o o Bi o Bi o Bi
Carbon Dioxide (CO2) _—
Facilities Management 325 Main St Mix (75% Argon/25% Mix § Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 S11.54
Wichita, KS 67203 cort (1qty)
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed (1 .
1 d No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 10.90
Facilities Management Wit K8 61203 Oxygen (02) T - o Bi o Bi o Bi $
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed "
XY 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 6.06
Facilities Management Wit K8 61203 Oxygen (02) R e o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed "
; J No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 3333
Facilities Management Wit K8 61203 Acetylene (C2H2) Al45 o o Bi o Bi o Bi $
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed "
; J No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 1159
Facilities Management Wit K8 61203 Acetylene (C2H2) B P o Bi o Bi o Bi $
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed "
”: N 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 9.25
Facilities Management Wit K8 61203 Acetylene (C2H2) MC e o Bi o Bi o Bi 5
SR 525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed "
J No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.00 1182
Facilities Management Wiehit, KS 67203 Argon (Ar) s o 0 Bi 0 Bi o Bi $
SR 525 Main St N Infrequent; As Needed "
/ J No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 .
Facilities Management Wiehita, K8 67203 Nitrogen (N2) v B 0 Bi 0 Bi o Bi
1021 Stillwell Wichita, Small (4) & "
F| N . No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
Fleet Management PN Aceryene (€2112) | SP S| frequents As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi
1021 Stillwell Wichita, Small (1) & "
F| N No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
Fleet Management XS 67213 Argon (Ar) Torge G4y | 'nfeaquent: As Needed 0 Bi 0 Bi 0 Bi
Fleet Management 1021 SEE‘L:IZ'IV; ichita, Nitrogen (N2) Large (1) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
1021 Stillwell Wichita, Small (6) & "
F N XY 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
Fleet Management PN Oxygen (02) sy | Mfrequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o B
"
Health Department 1500 E9StN. Dried Iee NA |60 Ibs. (400 Ibs./Month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wichita, KS 67214 March-October)
2716 W. Central Ave. . Py Jo Bi
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 20.65
Health Department Wi k8 ga0s | Liawid Nivogen (LN2) | 18 lier 5 gallons o Bi o Bi o Bi $
m
Public Works 3858 2477 St W Acetylene #4 96-147CF 915 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Andale, KS 67001 i
m
Public Works 3858 2477 St W Acetylene #5 228.441CF 282 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
Andale, KS 67001 i
i 25-
Public Works 3838 24775t W Oxygen 125251CF 2,128 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-$8.90;
Andale, KS 67001 Y 251-59.90
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Viola, KS 67149 -
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Acetylene #5 208441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
Viola, KS 67149 -
o vy
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-$8.90;
Viola, KS 67149 - 251-89.90
Public Works 17500 W 717, St § Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $19.80
Viola, KS 67149
)
Public Works 2200 § Webb Rd Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infiequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33

Wichita, KS 67207




2200 S Webb Rd

Public Works Wi, K 61207 Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
, 2200'S Webb Rd , 125-58.90
X - ; No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 d
Public Works Wi, K 61207 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed o Bi o Bi o Bi S
o
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $33.33
Wichita, KS 67226 i
m
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Acetylene #5 228441 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
Wichita, KS 67226 i
m
Public Works 10530 E 377 St N Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 125-$8.90;
Wichita, KS 67226 > 251-59.90
. 4701 S West St .
Public Works Wt KS 67217 Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infrequent; As Necded No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $3333
. 4701 S West St .
Public Works Wt KS 67217 Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
. 4701 S West St . 125-$8.90;
Public Works Wetita KS 67217 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 S
. 1015 Stillwell #16 .
Public Works Withitn K 67213 Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $3333
. 1015 Stillwell #16 .
Public Works Witk K 67213 Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 $86.86
. 1015 Stillwell #16 " 125-$8.90;
Public Works Witk K 61213 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 S
. 1015 Stillwell #16 .
Public Works Witk K 67213 Argon AG-25 381cf | Infrequent As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $19.80
T g 1109 N. Minneapolis | Ultra-High Pure Argon i
No Bid No Bid No Bid 22274
Regional Forensic Science Center ot K8 oot o T (330 ¢ 2 gallons o Bi o Bi o Bi B $26.10
" - " . 1109 N. Minneapolis .
Regional Forensic Science Center o K8 g | Regular Compressed Air | T (330 cf) 4 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.86 $9.00
" - " y 1109 N. Minneapolis Ultra-High Pure Helium .
No Bid No Bid No Bid 247.84
Regional Forensic Science Center Wit K8 oot s T (330 ¢ 50 gallons o Bi o Bi 0 Bi B S118.18
" - " . 1109 N. Minneapolis . .
Regional Forensic Science Center o K8 g | VlraHih Pure Nitvogen | T (330 cf) 18 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.34 $30.75
- . . 7750 N. Wild West Dr. Infrequent; As Needed "
i X d No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 :
Sedgwick County Fire District #1 Station 32 Park City, KS 67147 Oxygen (02) Q aty) o Bic 0 Bic o Bi $5.80
" Carbon Dioxide (C02)
Emergency Communications Radio Shop 1021 s“g“j‘;;’; ichita, | \fix (75% Argon/25% 150 CF Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 $11.54
co2)
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks
DELIVERED ITEMIZED
’ : Price per Cylinder | Price per | Price per Cylinder | Price per Price per
Department Address Gas Cy"";;f (ot uf::?:t:i '::;“;,"’i'c Ee sjge) Rental Fee | Cylinder Rental|  Rental Fee Cylinder Rental | Cylinder Rental
e up (Monthly) Fee (Monthly) (Monthly) Fee (Monthly) | Fee (Monthly)
700 S Hydraulic MC 101b; | Infrequent; As Necded
‘aci s Managg No Bi No Bi No Bi I 1 M
Facilities Management Wichte, £S 67211 Acetylene (C2H2) o ol P 0 Bid 0 Bid o Bid $19.50 50/
700 S Hydraulic Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 1 M
Facilities Management Wichitn KS 67211 Argon (Ar) 201b. 3 qn) 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 50/
700 S Hydraulic R
Facilities Management Wichitn KS 67211 Oxygen (02) 201b. Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 1.50M
700 S Hydraulic Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 1 M
Facilities Management Wichitn KS 67211 Nitrogen (N2) 401b, Lo 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 50/
622 E Central Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 1 M
Facilities Management Wanta kS om14 Oxygen (CO2) 201 s 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $15.00 50/
622 E Central Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 2! 1 M
Facilities Management Wichia, KS 67214 Acetylene (C2H2) 201b. o 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $25.00 50/
622 E Central Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 1 M
Facilities Management Wichia, KS 67214 Nitrogen (N2) 401b, 5 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $16.00 50/
Carbon Dioxide (C02) )
Facilities Management 141 W Elm Mix (75% Argon/25% 150 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67203 (I'aty)
co2)
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 24, 1 M
Facilities Management Wichia, K5 67203 Argon (An) 80 cf L 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $24.00 50/
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed
et No Bi No Bi No Bi 41 1 M
Facilities Management Wichita, KS 67203 Acetylene #2 60 cf L 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $41.00 50/
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi I 1 M
Facilities Management Wichit, KS 67203 Oxygen (02) 80 cf L 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $19.00 50/
141 W Elm Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 M
Facilities Management Wichia, KS 67203 Dissolved Acetylene Un1001 5 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $58.00 50/
) Carbon Dioxide (C02) )
Facilities Management 525 Main St Mix (75% Argon/25% Mix Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67203 (I'aty)
co2)
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 2! 1 M
Facilities Management Wichin KS 67203 Oxygen (02) T L 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $28.00 50/
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 1 M
Facilities Management Wichi KS 67203 Oxygen (02) R L 0 Bid 0 Bid o Bid $15.00 50/
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 1 M
Facilities Management Wichit, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) Alds 5 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $58.00 50/
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 2! 1 M
Facilities Management Wichi, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) B ) 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $25.00 50/
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi I 1 M
Facilities Management Wichit, KS 67203 Acetylene (C2H2) MC Lo 0 Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid $19.50 50/
525 Main St Infrequent; As Needed
No Bi No Bi No Bi 3. 1 M
Facilities Management Wit K8 67203 Argon (An) s i 0 Bid o Bid o Bid $33.00 50/
Facilities Management W‘cshz‘;"':("‘;“ 657‘203 Nitrogen (N2) v l“ﬁcquc(';‘:q’?ys)NCCdCd No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 1.50M
Fleet Management 1021 S"("Sl“;:'; Cg' fehita, | A cetylene (C2H2) S;?;é?éf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - 1.50M
Fleet Management 1021 S"("sl";:'; C’;’ ichita, Argon (Ar) 5;“::;:‘(::& Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - 1.50M
Fleet Management 1021 S"("sl";:'; C’;’ ichita, Nitrogen (N2) Large (1) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - 1.50M
Fleet Management 1021 S"("sl";:'; C’;’ ichita, Oxygen (02) 5;“:';:‘?;;& Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid - 1.50M
1900 E 9" StN 3,600 Ibs. (400 Ibs.Month
Health D« Di Tee N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ealth Department Wit &S emia ried Iee Vs Oetomnn) o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi
2716 W. Central Ave.
Health Department Wichita, KS 67203 Liquid Nitrogen (LN2) 18 liter 25 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 3.50M
m
Public Works 3858 247 St W Acetylene #4 96-147CF 915 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50M
Andale, KS 67001
m
Public Works 5858 2477 St. W Acetylene #5 228-441CF 282 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 1.50/M
Andale, KS 67001
m
Public Works. 5858 2477 St. W Oxygen 125-251CF 2,128 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 1.50M
Andale, KS 67001
Public Works 17500 W 717 St S Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50M
Viola, KS 67149
Public Works l7§00 W7I”. StS Acetylene #5 228-441 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 1.50/M
Viola, KS 67149
Public Works 17500 W 717 St§ Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 1.50M
Viola, KS 67149
Public Works 17500 W 717 St S Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 1.50M
Viola, KS 67149
] 2200'S Webb Rd i - A
Public Works. Wichita, KS 67207 Acetylene #4 96-147 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50/M
] 2200'S Webb Rd i R
Public Works Wichita, KS 67207 Acetylene #5 228-441 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 1.50/M
2200'S Webb Rd A
Public Works. Wichita, KS 67207 Oxygen 125-251 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 1.50/M
m
Public Works 10530 E 377 St. N Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67226
m
Public Works 10530 E 377 St. N Acetylene #5 228-441 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 1.50/M

Wichita, KS 67226




10530 E 37" St. N

Public Works Wonts 18 a2 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 LsoM
Public Works WAIZ&:RS‘X“;; ; Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50M
Public Works Wiz&::zg“;i‘l S Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 Ls0M
Public Works WAIZ&:RS‘X“;; ; Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 1.50M
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Acetylene #4 96-147 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 1.50M
Public Works ‘LO‘;;“"K‘;T;‘Z‘S Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 Ls0M
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 1.50M
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Argon AG-25 381 of Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 1.50M
Regional Forensic Science Center ‘\'\22]:“;’]'(";“::‘;‘;35 U"“'H‘g:’A':;"e ATEOn | (330 ¢ 2 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $222.74 1.50M
Regional Forensic Science Center 1109 N. Minneapolis | p o jar Compressed Air | T (330 ¢f) 4 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.86 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67214
Regional Forensic Science Center ‘\'\22]:“;’]'(";“::‘;‘;35 U"“’”‘g:‘!r:)’e Helium |1 (330 o) 50 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $247.84 1.5oM
Regional Forensic Science Center ‘\'\22]:“;’]'(";“::‘;‘;35 Ultra-High Pure Nitrogen| T (330 cf) 18 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.34 150M
Sedgvick Couny Fir Disict #1 Saion 32| 7720 . Wikd st Dr. Oxygen (02) Q In '*eq““(‘”z‘;q’f}?) Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid §19.00 LsoM
Emergency Communications Radio Shop 1021 SEIS“;'Z' g‘“h““' Twa.r:?;szj.og‘rieor(ucz?;: 150 CF Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 1.50M
co2)
Various Sealed/Contained Gases and/or Tanks
PICKED UP AT VENDOR SERVICE LOCATION
ITEMIZED
o [omres o e | e [Ee| e | e
(Monthly) | Fee (Monthly) | (Monthly) Fee (Monthly) | Fee (Monthly)
Facilities Management \,;‘”cfms; 'zg'g‘;lz‘fl Acetylene (C2H2) MCb‘(?l :]2 347 "‘frcq“fz'f‘; ’:fy;““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management \,;‘”cfms; ';Zgr?;lz'ﬁ Argon (Ar) 201b. l"frcq“(“z'f‘; ’:fy;““dcd No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management 700 S Hydraulic Oxygen (02) 201b, Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67211
Facilities Management \);‘”c?ms; lngrz‘;lzlfx Nitrogen (N2) 401, “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘ii‘zi a" E;“g’;‘zll . Oxygen (CO2) 201, “‘ﬁcq“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management w.ii.z. a" E;“g’;‘zll . Acetylene (C2H2) 201, “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management w.ii.z. a" E;“g’;‘zll . Nitrogen (N2) 401, “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management me;‘;’(:‘é“;m %/Ia:f ‘zlv‘sl;‘.u:‘riir(vcz?é: 150 cf l"ﬁcquc(“,‘:q?;deCd No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
co2)
Facilities Management Wmm;‘;’( :2‘;203 Argon (An) 80 cf “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management Wmm;‘; :2:203 Acetylene #2 60 cf “‘ﬁcq“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management Wmm;‘; :2:203 Oxygen (02) 80 cf “‘ﬁcq“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management Wmm;‘; :2:203 Dissolved Acetylene | Unl001 “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘;""‘('“‘;“ 657‘203 %/Ia:f ‘zlv‘sl;‘.u:‘riir(vcz?é: Mix mﬁcquc(“,‘:q?;deCd No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
co2)
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘;""‘('“‘;“ 657‘203 Oxygen (02) T “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘;""‘('“‘;“ 657‘203 Oxygen (02) R “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘fav"";‘;“ 657‘203 Acetylene (C2H2) Alds “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘;""‘('“‘;“ 657‘203 Acetylene (C2H2) B “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘fav"";‘;“ 657‘203 Acetylene (C2H2) MC “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘fav"";‘;“ 657‘203 Argon (An) s “‘f“q“j“l“q’l‘ys)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Facilities Management W‘:hz‘;""‘('“‘;“ 657‘203 Nitrogen (N2) v “‘f“q“j';“q’l‘;)'““d“d No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Fleet Management 12t S"("Sl“;:'; Cg' fehita, |\ cetylene (C2H2) S;?;é?éf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Fleet Management 12t S"("s“’;:'; C’;’ ichita, Argon (An) 5;“::;:‘(::& Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Fleet Management 12t S"("s“’;:'; C’;’ ichita, Nitrogen (N2) Large (1) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Fleet Management 12t S"("s“’;:'; C’;’ ichita, Oxygen (02) 5;“::;:‘?;;& Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Health Department W‘z‘:‘g: le 2‘72’14 Dried Iee N/A 3'600“25;6:3300 l':;e/r':""'“h No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid
Health Department zuinwcé';‘?;g‘; Liquid Nitrogen (LN2) | 18 liter 25 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 3.50M
Public Works :Sﬁ?‘z‘g 2‘70‘0’“1 Acetylene #4 96-147CF 915 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works :fg:le‘z: 2‘70\0)‘/1 Acetylene #5 228-441CF 282 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50/M
Public Works :fdsflcz,Alz: 2‘70\0)‘/1 Oxygen 125-251CF 2,128 Cu. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50/M
Public Works ‘zfg]‘l‘l; ‘;154‘95 Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works ‘zfg]‘l‘l; ‘;154‘95 Acetylene #5 28441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works ‘zfg]‘l‘z; ‘;154‘95 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works ‘zfg]‘l‘l; ‘;154‘95 Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works \ifcuh(?.i "‘Z;b;‘;& Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works. \)‘2/‘260}‘0“2 \;Z;b:7‘2{0d7 Acetylene #5 228-441 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50/M
Public Works \i‘zc”}ﬂ‘i ‘;Z;b:7‘2‘g7 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works "N”‘i;ﬁ: 1?5“)557‘222 Acetylene #4 96-147cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works "N”‘i;ﬁ: 1?5“)557‘222 Acetylene #5 28441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works "N”‘i;ﬁ: ‘3‘7;’657‘222 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works W‘:Z}?‘ ‘laslr';;‘;‘l , Acetylene #4 96-147¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works 4701'S West St Acetylene #5 28441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M

Wichita, KS 67217




4701 S West St

Public Works Wt KS 67217 Oxygen 125251 ¢f | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 LsoM
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Acetylene #4 96-147 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works ‘f‘;“i""“‘:‘g;‘z‘g Acetylene #5 228441 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 Ls0M
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Oxygen 125251 cf | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Public Works ‘20‘;‘2""“‘;627“2‘8 Argon AG-25 381 cf Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.40 1.50M
Regional Forensic Science Center ‘\'\22]:“;’]'(";“::‘;‘;35 U"“'H‘g:’A':;"e ATRON | (330 ¢ 2 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
Regional Forensic Science Center 1109 N. Minneapolis | p o jar Compressed Air | T (330 ¢f) 4 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67214
Regional Forensic Science Center ‘\'\22]:“;’]'(";“::‘;‘;35 U"“’”‘g:‘!r:)’e Helium |1 330 ¢py 50 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
Regional Forensic Science Center 1109 N. Minneapolis | 1.\ prion pure Nitrogen| T (330 cf) 18 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
Wichita, KS 67214
Sedgwick County Fire District #1 Station 32 7;2?&&”“2 S“:;;E’ Oxygen (02) Q In r’eq““("z';q’:;) Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
Emergency Communications Radio Shop 1021 s“"W;'Z‘ 1“;"“'"““' Twa.r:?;szj.og‘rieor(ucz?;: 150 CF Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 1.50M
co2)
Various Sealed/C ined Gases and/or Tanks A La Carte Pricing*
. . . . Price Per . . . . . .
Blesammien Unit of Measure Quantity/Estimated Price Per Unit of Unit of Price Per Unit of | Price Per Unit | Price Per Unit
Annual Usage Measure Measure Measure of Measure of Measure
High Pressure Cylinders:
LB Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid unsure of cyl size
10 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Mcsgc;g'olm $72.00
35 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid unsure of eyl size
40 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid B ;ﬁ‘;ﬁg“ $123.00
55 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
60 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
80 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)]sd‘zc not $181.00
125 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)fd‘“ not $215.00
150 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)fd‘“ not $246.00
200 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)]sd‘zc not $297.00
250 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
300 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)fd‘“ not $328.00
1 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
G3 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
G2 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
G Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
E Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)fd‘“ not $74.00
E2 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
D Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:)fd‘“ not $48.00
D2 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
DS Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
&) Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
Discount :Ji;j:z:‘x é:ﬂ;:f:;:iz Clinder Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid 40% off list
LB Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid unsure of cyl size
10 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid Mc ;;;'g:f““"
35 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid unsure of eyl size
40 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid B ;ﬁ‘;ﬁg“
55 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
60 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
80 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
125 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
150 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
200 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
250 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
300 Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not
J Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
a3 Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
a2 Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
G Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
E Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
E2 Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
D Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
D2 Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
DS Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
) Rental (Monthly) | Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid C"""d:l‘)fd‘zc not 1.50M
Rental Rate off any High Pressure Cylinder not Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid 40% off Tist

outlined above

Industrial gas cylinder (Rental Monthly)

$s.

Specialty Gas cylinder (Rental Monthly)

$9.00/cyl/month

Low Pressure Cylinders:




s Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
R Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
Q Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
T Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o) ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
s Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
P Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
N Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid o] ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not
Discount Rate off any Low Pressure Cylinder Purchase; EA Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid 40% off list
purchase not outlined above
s Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid cy ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
R Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid cy ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
Q Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid <y ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
T Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid cy ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
TS Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid <y ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
P Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid cy ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
N Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid cy ]‘“d:;lsd‘”e not 1.50M
Rental Rate off any Low Pressure Cylinder not Rental (Monthly) Infrequent; As Needed No Bid No Bid No Bid
outlined above
Industrial gas cylinder (Rental Monthly) - - - $5.40/cyUmonth -
Specialty Gas cylinder (Rental Monthly) - - - $9.00/cyUmonth -
[Acetylene Cylinders:
MC (10 ) No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.00 $48.00
B (40 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.00 $80.00
75 (75 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:;lsd‘ze not $144.00
#4 (130 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:;lsd‘ze not $206.00
#5 (300 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; lsd‘ze not $379.00
310 No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; o not
210 No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; o not
160 No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; o not
Discount Rate off any Acetylene Cylinder purchase NoBid NoBid NoBid Jr—
not outlined above
MC (10 ¢y No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.00
B (40 < No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.00
75 (75 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid CY"""‘;;‘R not
#4 (130 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:;lsd‘ze not
#5 (300 cf) No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; lsd‘ze not
310 No Bid No Bid No Bid eylinder size not
sold
210 No Bid No Bid No Bid eylinder size not
sold
160 No Bid No Bid No Bid Cy""d:; o not
Rental Ratc off any Ac:tli/‘l)e:c Cylinder not outlined NoBid NoBid NoBid
v
*Cylinders listed in table arc referenced from tables below: duplications on pricing table may appear duc to attempt o cover different vendor's identification and reporting of cylinder sizes within industry. Please provide cither same price for duplicate instances or indicate, "SAME
High Pressure Cylinders
High Pressure Steel |
Acotviens Cyimdors iy vom LB1O D 20 E 35 40 S5 6 B0 125 180 200 290 300
310 210 180
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Grainger . ) .
B it | e || SR IO || G Cirtges
= Supply Industrial Supply | Industrial Supply
NoBid Heathwood Oil Co.,| ~ Murdock [ Murdock Companies|  Murdock Murdock
Inc. Companies Inc. Inc. Companies Inc. | Companics Inc.
Petroleum Traders | Security Oil e e .
o e Security Oil LLC [ Security Oil LLC| Security Oil LLC
Wayman Oil Co.

On behalf of various departments, recommend to accept the low overallbids from Central Gas Service, LLC for Tract 1 and Matheson for Tract 3 and establish contracted rates for one (1) year with four (4) one (1) year
options to renew.

Tract 1 identifes a continued need to contract Liquid Propane (LP) gas departments needs on a contiued basis at locations not utilizing natural gas services or as a back up source of energy. Tract 3 identifies and addresses the need for
contracted rates for various sealed/contained gases and/or tanks for departments gases usage for various needs including but not limited to welding and medical and scientific testing.

Notes:
Tract 2 was unawarded and all bids rejected due to multiple errors found from all vendor submissions that when reviewed determined a need to rebid seperately at a later date.
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