
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 1, 2021

     FUNDING -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
     (Request sent to 14 vendors)

     RFB #21-0011 Contract

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP 12,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years 8,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year No Bid
4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control 4,000 rounds per year No Bid

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (AC 9-4N) 175,000 rounds per year $44,000.00
6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (AC 223-1N) 65,000 rounds per year $23,000.00
7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" (50135) 9,000 rounds per year $3,250.00
Estimated Delivery Time

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP 12,000 rounds every 2 years $4,315.61
2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years 8,000 rounds every 2 years No Bid
3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year No Bid
4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control 4,000 rounds per year $2,389.27

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 175,000 rounds per year $36,739.94
6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 65,000 rounds per year $26,835.29
7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" 9,000 rounds per year $2,702.48
Estimated Delivery Time

Duty Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

1. Speer LE 9mm Luger+P 124 Gr. GDHP (Winchester RA9BA) 12,000 rounds every 2 years $0.355/rd: $4,260.00
2. Hornady TAP .223 REM 53 gr GMX TAP PATROL 2 years (55GR 
Winchester RA223BSTAY) 8,000 rounds every 2 years $0.699/rd: $5,592.00

3. Winchester Ranger Segmented Rifled Slug RA12RS15S 3,000 rounds per year $0.57/rd: $1,710.00
4. Federal Premium LE 9 pellet 00Buck flight control (Winchester 
RA12005) 4,000 rounds per year $0.47/rd: $1880.00

Practice Ammunition Estimated Usage Price Per Stated 
Estimated Usage

5. 9mm 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (USA9MM) 175,000 rounds per year $0.194/rd: $33,950.00
6. .223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass (USA 223 RIKY) 65,000 rounds per year $0.339/rd: $22,035.00
7. 12 Gauge #6, 7 ½, or 8 Bird Shot 2 3/4" (TRGT127) 9,000 rounds per year $0.25/rd: $2,250.00

Estimated Delivery Time

No Bid Kiesler Police Supply The Hunting Shack

Precision Delta

RA9BA; RA223BSTAY; USA223RIKY 60-90 Days                                                               
USA9MM; RA12RS15S; RA12005; TRGT127                         

120-180 Days

BOCC APPROVED APRIL 7, 2021

Armscor Cartridge Inc. dba ACI

30 Days
G T Distributors, Inc.

6-12 Months/normally 3-4 Months

4.  SHERIFF'S OFFICE AMMUNITION -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE

On the recommendation of Lee Barrier, on behalf of Sheriff's Office, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the 
bids from G T Distributors, Inc. for items one (1) and four (4) and from Precision Delta for item 
three (3), and items five (5) through (seven) 7 and establish contract pricing for three (3) years 
with two (2) one (1) year options to renew. Russell Leeds seconded the motion. The motion passed 
three (3) to one (1) with Tim Myers abstaining.



Questions and Answers  

Kirk Sponsel: At any time would anyone like to recuse themselves from this discussion for these items? 

Tim Myers: Do you want me to recuse myself from the discussion or from the vote?

Kirk Sponsel: It would have to be from both.

Tim Myers: Okay, I will recuse myself, Tim Myers, since I am employed by the Sedgwick County 
Sheriff's Office and these items are for the Sheriff's Office.

Russell Leeds: The duty ammunition from G T Distributors, Inc. cost difference appears fairly small. 
The estimated delivery time, there is a difference between Precision and G T. I was curious as to the 
selection of items one (1) and four (4) from G T Distributors relative to the bid and time delivery of 
Precision Delta?

Gregory Pollock: We have done extensive research on the rounds we currently use. There has been 
specific testing that has been done. Precision submitted their bid with alternative rounds, which are not 
consistent with testing done on the ammo rounds. We have been using these in service for the last 15 
years and they are consistent with the FBI protocols and accuracy for our weapons. We deferred to the 
other bid for the results and consistency of these rounds. 

Russell Leeds: Precision Delta bid an alternative ammunition, it appears on paper to be a similar make 
and brand of the ammunition, but they bid an alternative? 

Gregory Pollock: That is correct.
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